
Valley 
eleVator Inc 

Services 
 
 
 
 
 
With 70 years combined experience, Valley 
Elevator Inc strives to provide competitively 
priced service and equipment in a professional 
manner.  When working with Valley Elevator, 
you will not have to wait for salesmen to be 
called in, approval committees to convene, and 
mechanics to be dispatched; then wait again as 
mechanics try to get approvals for parts to 
make your equipment run correctly. We will 
listen to your concerns, survey your equipment 
and have a proposal for repair or upgrade to 
you within days, not weeks or months. We 
know what is needed to make your equipment 
run smoothly and safely. 
 

• All Inclusive Contracts 

• Elevator Repair & Maintenance 

• Escalator Repair & Maintenance 

• Troubleshooting 

• State-Required Testing 

• Modernization 

• Metal Cleaning 

• Elevator Door Murals 
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Valley 
eleVator 

Inc 
A Passion for Excellent Service 

 

Product/Service Information 

 

559-779-0872 

 

  
 



 

MODERNIZATION 

If your older elevator has recurring problems, 
perhaps it is time to consider modernizing your 
equipment. Modernization projects can include 
not only new machines and controllers to make 
your elevator more reliable, but also new cab 
interiors.  We install non-proprietary equipment 
that can be maintained and repaired by any 
qualified technician.  You will not be held 
hostage by the big company brands’ ridiculous 
prices for replacement parts. We can upgrade 
your building by upgrading your elevator.   
 

All Inclusive Maintenance 
Contracts 

We offer contracts from "inspection only" or 
"testing only" to "all-inclusive" which includes 
all maintenance, repairs, inspection, fire testing 
and State-required load testing.  
 
It's important to read the fine print of an 
agreement.  
 
Most elevator service agreements do not include 
monthly maintenance and support. Ours does. 
"All inclusive" means just that, we include it all. 
 
 

 

 

  TROUBLESHOOTING AND 
DIAGNOSTICS 
 

We have worked on elevators and other vertical 
transportation of nearly all brands and of all 
ages. Our technicians have maintained and 
repaired elevators in early 20th century buildings 
to modern computer-controlled elevators in 
sleek new buildings in San Francisco and the Bay 
Area, from Sacramento, to Eureka, to 
Bakersfield to Fresno and all up and down the 
Valley.   
 
They have the knowledge, expertise and 
equipment necessary to troubleshoot and 
diagnose your elevator problems, and to repair 
them properly—all while being dependable, 
trustworthy and friendly!   
 

 

Call us today for your free estimate. 

 

 
 

  ELEVATOR SERVICE  

AND REPAIR 
We service and repair all elevator brands. With 
70 years of combined experience we know 
how to fix it right the first time.  
 
We service the following elevator brands: 
Thyssen-Krupp, Dover, Otis, Amtech, 
Schindler, Westinghouse, Kone, Montgomery, 
US, Motion Control, Elevator Controls, ERM, 
Swift, Virginia Controls and others. 
 
Dumbwaiters, Material Lifts, Wheelchair Lifts, 
Stair Lifts, Manlifts     

STATE REQUIRED TESTING 

We are fully qualified and licensed to perform 

all State-required testing, including: 

• Five-year full-load tests 

• Fire testing 

• Annual no-load tests 

• Semi-annual wheelchair lift tests 

 

 

Contact Us 

Valley Elevator Inc 

90 E Escalon Ave Ste 109 

Fresno, Ca 93710 

559-779-0872 

info@valleyelevator.com 

Visit us on the Web: 

www.valleyelevator.com 
 

 


